INSTRUCTION MANUAL

GREENLEE.

A Textron Company

RKOGFT
Hydraulic
Crimping Tool

Read and understand all of the instructions and
safety information in this manual before operating
or servicing this tool.

99930935 © 2006 Greenlee Textron Inc. IM 1372 REV 5 2/06



RKO6FT Hydraulic Crimping Tool

@ GREENLEE.

Table of Contents

D1 To7 o o] (o o PSRRI 2
PUIMPOSE ... 2
Important Safety Information .............ccccccviveeene . 3-4
Identification ..., 5
Specifications ... 5
OPEration ........oceeeiiiiiiiiee e 6-7
Connector Selection ..........ccooevviiicciiiiieeeee e 8
Periodic Pressure Relief Valve Check ...........ccccuevenneee. 8
HUSEratioNS ....ccoeeeeeeeeeeee e 9-10
Parts List ..o 11
Description

The RKO6FT Hydraulic Crimping Tool is a dieless
crimping tool intended to crimp aluminum and copper
connectors onto electrical cable.

The RKO6FT is to be coupled to any Greenlee or
Greenlee Fairmont hydraulic pump capable of develop-
ing 700 Bar (10,000 psi). Suggested pumps include:

Pump Type Model Number
Hand PUmp ... 755

Electric Pump (120-Volt Models) .......cccccceeeeennnnn. 975

Fairmont PPS 1020

Electric Pump (220-Volt Models) ................ 976-22FS
976-22PS
980-22FS
980-22PS

Fairmont Intensifier ........ccocooeviiiiieiiiiiieeeenns H6710B*
H6710B1*
H6710B4*

* Requires PVA0021 Control Valve

Safety

Safety is essential in the use and maintenance of
Greenlee tools and equipment. This instruction manual
and any markings on the tool provide information for
avoiding hazards and unsafe practices related to the
use of this tool. Observe all of the safety information
provided.

Purpose

This manual is intended to familiarize all personnel with
the safe operation and maintenance procedures for the
following Greenlee tool:

RKO6FT Hydraulic Crimping Tool
Keep this manual available to all personnel.

Replacement manuals are available upon request at no
charge.

All specifications are nominal and may change as design improve-
ments occur. Greenlee Textron Inc. shall not be liable for damages
resulting from misapplication or misuse of its products.

Blackburn is a registered trademark of Thomas & Betts.

KEEP THIS MANUAL

Greenlee / A Textron Company
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IMPORTANT SAFETY INFORMATION

SAFETY
ALERT
SYMBOL

This symbol is used to call your attention to hazards
or unsafe practices which could result in an injury

or property damage. The signal word, defined below,
indicates the severity of the hazard. The message
after the signal word provides information for prevent-
ing or avoiding the hazard.

ADANGER

Immediate hazards which, if not avoided, WILL result
in severe injury or death.

AWARNING

Hazards which, if not avoided, COULD result in
severe injury or death.

ACAUTION

Hazards or unsafe practices which, if not avoided,
MAY result in injury or property damage.

AWARNING

Read and understand all of the
instructions and safety information in
this manual before operating or
servicing this tool.

Failure to observe this warning could
result in severe injury or death.

AWARNING

Electric shock hazard:

This tool is not insulated. When
using this unit on or near energized
electrical lines, use proper personal
protective equipment.

Failure to observe this warning could
result in severe injury or death.

v

AWARNING

Wear eye protection when operating
this tool.

Failure to wear eye protection could
result in serious eye injury from
flying debris or hydraulic oil.

AWARNING

Skin injection hazard:

Oil under pressure easily punctures
skin causing serious injury, gan-
grene or death. If you are injured by
escaping oil, seek medical attention
immediately.

+ Hand-tighten all couplers com-
pletely before operating the pump.
Do not use tools.

* Do not use hands to check for
leaks.

+ Do not hold the hose or couplers
while the hydraulic system is
pressurized.

+ Depressurize the hydraulic system
before servicing.

Greenlee / A Textron Company
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IMPORTANT SAFETY INFORMATION

AWARNING

AWARNING

An incomplete crimp can cause a fire.

+ Use proper connector and cable combinations.
Improper combinations can result in an incom-
plete crimp.

+ Crimp until the pump has reached relief pressure.
If you do not achieve relief pressure you will have
an incomplete crimp.

Failure to observe these warnings could result in
severe injury or death.

AWARNING

Inspect tool before use. Replace any worn or
damaged parts. A damaged or improperly as-
sembled tool can break and strike nearby personnel.

Failure to observe this warning could result in
severe injury or death.

AWARNING

Keep hands away from the crimping
tool head when crimping.

B

Failure to observe this warning could
result in severe injury or death.

AWARNING

Follow the instructions and safety information
supplied with the pump.

Failure to observe this warning could result in severe
injury or death.

Use only Greenlee supplied hoses and couplers.
Other manufacturers’ components may fail.

Failure to observe this warning could result in
severe injury or death.

ACAUTION

Do not operate the tool without a connector in
place. Damage to the ram or crimping tool head
can result.

Failure to observe this precaution may result in
injury and property damage.

Note: Keep decals clean and legible. Replace decals
when necessary.

Greenlee / A Textron Company
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Identification
RKO6FT
1. Crimping Head
2. Flip Top
3. Decal
4. Decal
5. Coupler
Specifications
Crimping Tool
Length ..o 269.7 mm (10.62")
WIOEH e 133.4 mm (5.25")
HEIGNT e 63.5 mm (2.5")
MasSS/WEIGht ........eeeiieii e 2.7kg (51b 15 0z)
Crimping Capacities
Crimping Range
ATUMINUM L #6 AWG to 750 kcmil
@7 0] o] o= (PSR #4 AWG to 750 kemil
CrimpiNg FOICE ...oooiiiiiiei e 55 kN (6.2 tons)
Greenlee / A Textron Company 5 4455 Boeing Dr. « Rockford, IL 61109-2988 USA - 815-397-7070
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Operation

AWARNING AWARNING

Electric shock hazard: An incomplete crimp can cause a fire.

This tool is not insulated. When + Use proper connector and cable combinations.

using this tool on or near energized Improper combinations can result in an incom-
‘ electrical lines, use proper personal plete crimp.

protective equipment.

i ) ) + Crimp until the pump has reached relief pressure.
Failure to observe this warning could If you do not achieve relief pressure you will have
result in severe injury or death. an incomplete crimp.

Failure to observe these warnings could result in

severe injury or death.
AWARNING
Wear eye protection when operatin
thio tool. peraing AWARNING
Failure to wear eye protection could
u’ Keep hands away from the crimping
#y | tool head when crimping.

result in serious eye injury from
flying debris or hydraulic oil.

Failure to observe this warning could
result in severe injury or death.

AWARNING
Skin injection hazard: AWARNING

Oil under pressure easily punctures
skin causing serious injury, gan-

grene or death. If you are injured by Follow the instructions and safety information
escaping oil, seek medical attention supplied with the pump.

immediately. Failure to observe this warning could result in severe
+ Hand-tighten all couplers com- injury or death.

pletely before operating the pump.
Do not use tools.

* Do not use hands to check for
leaks.

+ Do not hold the hose or couplers
while the hydraulic system is
pressurized.

+ Depressurize the hydraulic system
before servicing.
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@ GREENLEE. RKO6FT Hydraulic Crimping Tool

Operation (cont’d)

1. Follow the lug manufacturer’s instructions for appro-
priate cable strip length and surface preparation.

2. Insert cable fully into connector.

3. Pull the latch pin and open the latch. Insert the
connector with cable into the crimping head. Close
the latch and push the pin completely into the latch.

CRIMPING DIRECTIOM

1ST COMPRESSION

ACAUTION CRIMPING DIRECTION

SIDE B
Do not operate the crimping tool unless the latch is 15T COMPRESSION /
completely closed and secured with the latch pin. SIDEA
Failure to observe this precaution may result in \

injury or property damage.

4. Center the connector between the nibs.

/ 1ST COMPRESSION
SIDE B

CRIMPING DIRECTION

IMPORTANT SIDE A

Small connectors may become 5. Using the sequence illustrated here, activate the
RIGHT wedged between the nibs of the pump to advance the nibs. Continue crimping until

- tool. Center the connector between the pressure relief valve activates.

GEN the. four nibs before crimping. 6. After achieving pressure relief, release the hydraulic
Failure to observe this precaution pressure at the pump. The ram will automatically
can cause property damage. return to the start position and the nibs will retract.

WRONG 7. Complete the number of crimps specified by the

connector manufacturer.
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Connector Selection

Tool Range: Copper — #4 AWG to 750 kemil (except as noted 4)
Aluminum — #6 AWG to 750 kcmil (except as noted J)

This tool is cUL and UL classified for use with the following connector brands:

CONNECTOR | BARREL | ANDERSON | BLACKBURN® BURNDY ILSCO PANDUIT T&B PENN-UNION | NUMBER
TYPE TYPE OF CRIMPS
COPPER SHORT VHSS cspA ys-LA cT SCSS/SCSA | 54507-54523TBA BCU
SPLICES
LONG VHS cud ysA CTL SCL/SCHA |  54807-548232 BBCU
COPPER SHORT VHCS CTL-2/CTLA | YA-2LN/YA-L/YA-2LA CRA/CRB  |LCAS/LCAZ | 54107-54123TBA BLU .
LUGS YA/YA-L-TC/YA-L-2TC LCD 54207-54223
LONG VHCL CTL-L/LCNA YA-2NA CRA-L/CRB-L | LCB/LCCA |54933BE-54923BEA BBLU
CRA-2L/CRB-2L 54855BE-54880BE
DUAL-RATED — VACS AspH YS-A< AS sAd 60507-50578 PIKH
ALUMINUM
SPLICES -
DUAL-RATED — VACL ATLY YA-AX ACL/ACN LAAH 6010660178 BLUAH
ALUMINUM YA-ATN 2ACL/2ACN LAB 60230-60278
LUGS
SIS Use the number of crimps listed below instead A #2 AWG to 750 kemil
of the number provided with the connector: i
c us . _ . _ O Blackburn:  #4 to 750 kemil
ppt #4110 4/0: 1 crimp #6to#1: 1 crimp Burndy: #4 10 750 kemil
250 t0 600: 2 crimps 1/0to 350: 2 crimps Panduit: #4 10 500 kemil
750: 3 crimps 400 to 600: 3 crimps Penn-Union: #6 to 500 kcmil
750: 4 crimps

Periodic Pressure Relief Valve Check

Test the crimping tool periodically to ensure that the 5. Evaluate the test slug as follows:

pressure relief valve activates at the proper pressure. - If the test slug does not fit into GO slot, the pres-
sure relief valve is set too high. Refer to the pump
instructions for adjusting the relief valve.

1. Center a test slug between the nibs. + If the test slug fits into the GO slot, the pressure
2. Close the latch and push the pin completely into the relief valve is set correctly.

latch. + If the test slug fits into the NO GO slot, the pres-
sure relief valve is set too low. Refer to the pump

ACAUTION instructions for adjusting the relief valve.

Do not operate the crimping tool unless the latch is
completely closed and secured with the latch pin. GO

Testing the Crimping Tool

Failure to observe this precaution may result in
injury and property damage.

NO GO

3. Activate the pump to advance the nibs. Continue
crimping until the pressure relief valve activates.

4. After achieving pressure relief, release the hydraulic
pressure at the pump. The ram will automatically
return to the start position and the nibs will retract.
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lllustration
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Parts List

Key Part No. Description Qty
50017225 Quad point flip-top head assembly (includes 100—119)
100 50017276 PN, SPIING .cco e 2
101 50017233 Cam yoke asSembIY .......ooceiiiiiiiiiie e 1
102 50061178 LAECR < 1
103 50061275 MOVING SIE JAW ...ecvviiiieiitieiee ettt 2
104 50060898 ROIIEr DEANNGS ...eeiiiiiiiiiie e 12
105 50060880 Bearing retainers ........oooeee i 2
106 50061216 Latch mounting Pin ......ooueeoii e 1
107 50061186 LatCh NID ..o 1
108 50061240 LOCK PN et 1
109 52023662 HEA COVET ...t 2
111 50061160 SidE JAW TOHIET ... s 2
112 50060910 COMPIreSSION SPINQG ....cciuvierieeriierieeeiee st erieesee et e e e e e eeeesaeeeanes 2
113 50060961 Ball SCIEW ...t 1
115 50061224 SNAP FING ettt 2
116 50061003 Socket head Cap SCrEW .......ccccooiuiiiiiriieiieeree e 2
117 50061038 Socket head Cap SCreW .........cccuvieeeiiiiiiiiie e 2
119 50083660 SEESCIBW ...ttt s 1
121 50060970 Socket head cap screw, 10-32 X .62" .......ccceeeercereiiee e e 1
122 50061054 Piston master CYliNAEr .........oooiiiiiiii e 1
123 50061046 JLIC=1 1T o I o) 1 P PPPPPRPR 1
124 50060945 Main ram return SPriNG .....c.eooveeeiiiee e e 1
125 50061062 MaSEEr CYIINAEY ... e e 1
126 50061127 SPrNG ANCIOT ... e 1
127 50061283 SEAIKIt ..ttt 1
128 90508238 Coupler w/ dust cap (NOt SHOWN) .....cceeriiiiiiiiieiie e 1
50018825 Decal, connector compatibility ...........cccoveriiiiien e 1
50060821 DECAL, ID ..t e s 1
Kits

50061291 Bearing/retainer kit (includes 104, 105)
50063081 10 Test slugs with gage
50106368 Case, carrying
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